

UNOFFICIAL BID RESULTS

COUNTY	UNIT	ACRES	BID AMOUNT	POTENTIAL LESSEE
Adair	CMS 1 North	274	\$13,520.00	Bryce David Miller
Adair	CMS 1 South	93	\$10,002.00	Zachary James Auffet
Adair	CMS 2	458	\$31,826.00	Kyle Woods or Weston Henson
Adair	CMS 4	180.7	\$7,686.00	Travis Lee Starr
Adair	CMS 5	385	\$18,430.00	Zachary James Auffet
Adair	CMS 7	271.5	\$23,502.00	Zachary James Auffet
Adair	CMS 8	80	\$1,600.00	Paul Jason Warford
Adair	CMS 9	60	\$1,200.00	Paul Jason Warford
Adair	CMS 10	65	\$2,890.00	Michael Joe Starr
Adair	CMS 11	89	\$7,667.00	Travis Lee Starr
Adair	CMS 12	160	\$5,868.00	Travis Lee Starr
Adair	CMS 14	458	\$18,100.00	Chad Allen & Sweeny Gillette
Adair	CMS 15	107	\$3,871.42	Artie David Brown
Adair	CMS 17	145	\$3,500.71	Artie David Brown
Adair	CMS 18	20	\$1,685.00	Tommy Joe Asbill or Destiny Wilhite
Adair	CMS 18D	18	\$700.00	Tommy Joe Asbill or Destiny Wilhite
Adair	CMS 19	157	\$7,800.00	Mary Jane Hammer
Sequoyah	CMS 20	208	\$7,425.00	Marty Horn
Adair	CMS 21	70	\$6,000.00	Brock Levoy Demaree
Adair	CMS 21A	150	\$7,007.00	Marty Horn
Adair	CMS 23	140	\$3,100.00	Bryce David Miller
Adair	CMS 24	32	\$1871.04	Adam Milliam Brown
Adair	CMS 25	201.80	\$5,500.00	Danny Duane Braden
Adair	CMS 27	238	\$6,675.00	Marty Horn
Adair	CMS 28	70	\$4,435.89	Tyler Lee Choate
Adair	CMS 29	28	\$2871.50	Adam Milliam Brown
Adair	CMS 32	27	\$1,151.81	Adam Milliam Brown
Adair	CMS 33	150	\$8,126.00	Travis Lee Starr
Adair	CMS 34	120	\$6,978.00	Travis Lee Starr
Adair	CMS 35	40	\$3,996.00	Travis Lee Starr
Adair	CMS 36	110	\$6,533.21	Adam Milliam Brown
Adair	CMS 37 A	11	\$500.00	Bryce David Miller
Adair	CMS 37	20	\$1,600.00	Jeffery Lynn Patterson
Adair	CMS 38	96	\$1,850.71	Artie David Brown
Adair	CMS 39	90.7	\$3,001.00	Bryce David Miller
Adair	CMS 39A	45	\$1,390.00	Bryce David Miller
Adair	CMS 40	85	\$2,701.54	Artie David Brown
Adair	CMS 43	80	\$6,190.00	Travis Lee Starr
Cherokee	PARK HILL	22	\$1,660.00	Mary Soap & Phil Givins
Cherokee	ROCKY FORD 1	44	\$1,800.00	Beau James Kester
Cherokee	ROCKY FORD 3	68	\$2,250.00	Beau James Kester
Cherokee	SEQUOUAH 3	71	\$2,600.00	James Robert Drywater
Craig	Craig 1	30		NO BID
Craig	VINITA	20	\$550.00	Kay Paul Ross

Delaware	TILLERY UNIT	117.5	\$9,125.00	Tracey Bower
Delaware	COLCORD 440	440	\$28,600.00	Guy Donald & Retha Osburn
Delaware	KEN 2	85	\$5,005.00	Joshua Bradley Butcher Jr.
Delaware	KEN 5	590	\$10,000.00	Joshua Bradley Butcher Jr.
Delaware	KEN 9A	120	\$6501.00	Joshua Bradley Butcher Jr.
Delaware	KEN 10	135	\$3,321.71	Adam Milliam Brown
Delaware	KEN 13	50	\$1,302.00	Anthony Wayne Hopton
Delaware	KEN 14	590	\$17,500.00	Joshua Bradley Butcher Jr.
Delaware	KEN 14A	65	\$5,501.00	Joshua Bradley Butcher Jr.
Delaware	KEN 14B	350	\$7,500.00	Joshua Bradley Butcher Jr.
Delaware	KEN 18	263	\$6,502.00	Anthony Wayne Hopton
Delaware	KEN 22	57		NO BID
Delaware	KEN 23	248	\$8,651.00	Dannie Lee Martin
Delaware	KEN 25	360	\$10,500.00	Joshua Bradley Butcher, Jr.
Delaware	KEN 26	247	\$17,500.00	Joshua Bradley Butcher, Jr.
Delaware	KEN 27	100	\$6,500.00	Joshua Bradley Butcher, Jr.
Delaware	KEN 28	396	\$15,005.00	Joshua Bradley Butcher Jr.
Delaware	KEN 29	500	\$10,500.00	Joshua Bradley Butcher Jr.
Delaware	KEN 30	164	\$4,975.00	Dustin Edward Jones
Delaware	KEN 31	760	\$15,000.00	Joshua Bradley Butcher Jr.
Delaware	KEN 32	230	\$7,250.00	Steven Wayne Odle & Anita Jean Odle
Delaware	KEN 33	370	\$7,500.00	Joshua Bradley Butcher Jr.
Delaware	KEN 34	600	\$15,500.00	Joshua Bradley Butcher Jr.
Delaware	KEN 37	670	\$14,400.50	Guy Donald Osburn
Delaware	KEN 39	35	\$751.31	Adam Milliam Brown
Delaware	KEN 40	60	\$4,350.00	Dustin Edward Jones
Delaware	KEN 41 (hay)	85		NO BID
Delaware	TOOLATE (hay)	20		NO BID
Mayes	YONKERS	120	\$3,505.00	Bradley Todd Smith
Muskogee	ROSS ROAD	255.33	\$10,200.00	Hunter Grayson O'Dell
Muskogee	WARNER	90	\$1,500.00	Mark Alan Sexton
Sequoyah	SEQUOYAH'S CABIN		\$3,500.00	Thomas Lee Casados
Washington	OCHELATA	210	\$5,200.00	Kay Paul Ross